
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
Date___________________________ Birthday  

Name  Social Security #:  

Address  Phone  

City  State  Zip  

Spouse’s Name  

Children’s Names  Age  

   Age  

   Age  

   Age  

Church Affiliation  Name of Congregation  

Position Desired  

PERSONAL TESTIMONY 

How long have you been a Christian?  

Please share your personal testimony.  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

 

How long have you had an interest in Christian Education?  

Substitute Teacher Application 

Christian Academy Schools 
2151 W. Russell Rd. Sidney, Ohio 45365 

Phone: 937-492-7556    Fax: 937-492-5399 
 

 
Our Mission is to Equip and Inspire Students to be a New Generation of Christ-Centered Leaders 

 

 



 

EDUCATIONAL EXPERIENCE 

Last School Attended  

College Attended  

Grades Completed  

Degree  

Major  

 
WORK EXPERIENCE 

 Name Address Dates 

      

      

      

 

REFERENCES 

Name  

Address  

Phone  Position  

 
Name  

Address  

Phone  Position  

 
Name  

Address  

Phone  Position  



 

 

 

 
Lifestyle Statement for Christian Academy Schools 

 

Christian Academy Schools is a religious, nonprofit organization representing Jesus 
Christ throughout the local community. Christian Academy Schools requires its 
employees to be born-again Christians, living their lives as Christian role models (Rom. 
10:9-10, 1 Tim. 4:12, Luke 6:40). Employees will conduct themselves in a way that will 
not raise questions regarding their Christian testimonies. A Christian lifestyle should 
reflect the biblical perspective of integrity, appropriate personal and family relationships, 
business conduct, and moral behavior. An employee is expected to demonstrate a 
teachable spirit, an ability to share a love for others, a willingness to live contently under 
authority, and a commitment to follow the Matthew 18 principle when an issue arises 
with fellow employees or management. 
 

The Christian Academy Schools Statement of Faith expects employees to maintain a 
lifestyle based on biblical standards of moral conduct. Moral misconduct, which violates 
the bona fide occupational qualification for employees to be Christian role models, 
includes, but is not limited to, promiscuity and homosexual behavior or any other 
violation of the unique roles of male and female (Rom. 1:21-27, 1 Cor. 6:9-20). Christian 
Academy Schools believe that biblical marriage is limited to a covenant relationship 
between a man and a woman. 
 

Christian Academy Schools employees will maintain a lifestyle based on biblical 
standards of conduct. Failure to do so may result in a reprimand or, in some cases, 
dismissal from employment. It is the goal of Christian Academy Schools that each 
employee will have a lifestyle in which “He may have the preeminence” (Col. 1:18, 
NKJV). 
 
 

Statements of Faith 
 

1. I believe the Bible to be the inspired and the only infallible authoritative Word of God. 

2. I believe that there is one God, eternally existent in three persons. Father, Son, and 

Holy Spirit. 

3. I believe in the deity of our Lord Jesus Christ, in His virgin birth, in His sinless life, in 

His miracles, in His vicarious and atoning death through His shed blood, in His 

bodily resurrection, in His ascension to the right hand of the Father, and in His 

personal return in power and glory. 

4. I believe that man is sinful by nature and that regeneration by the Holy Spirit is 

essential for his salvation 

5. I believe in the continuing ministry of the Holy Spirit, by whose indwelling the 

Christian is enabled to live a Godly life. 

6. I believe in the resurrection of both the saved and the lost. They who are saved unto 

eternal life and they who are lost unto eternal damnation. 

7. I believe in the spiritual unity of believers in our Lord Jesus Christ. 
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8. I believe in the creation of man by the direct Act of God. 

9. We believe that the term marriage has only one meaning: the uniting of one man 

and one woman in a single, exclusive union, as delineated in Scripture (Genesis 

2:18-25). We believe that God intends sexual intimacy to occur only between a man 

and a woman who are married to each other (I Corinthians 6:18, 7:2-5; Hebrews 

13:4). We believe that God’s command is that there be no sexual intimacy outside or 

apart from marriage between a man and a woman. 

10. We believe that God wonderfully foreordained and immutably created each person 

as either male or female in conformity with their biological sex. These two distinct yet 

complementary genders together reflect the image and nature of God. (Genesis 

1:26-27). 

 
 

 

 

 

 I acknowledge that I have read and agree with the Statements of Faith. 

 I acknowledge that I have read and agree with the Lifestyle Statement. 

 I acknowledge that I have read and agree with the Staff Handbook 
 
 
Print Name__________  

Signature  

Date   

Role   (i.e., substitute, board, teacher, etc.) 

  

 
 
 


